
Seeking One's Self
Sometimes one tries to figure out what direction, one may 
take. They may have a spiritual vision in their seeking, from a 
top of a hill, south of where they are from. 

They may be given direction from one family to say lets go 
this way and not be what society may list them as “traitors or 
thieves”. If a fingerprint shows they went that direction, part 
of the family may not want to accept it and say that the so 
called being “traitors or thieves” was not real.

If one comes from the name of Robert who's father is an 
Allen.



Rimington, Lancashire Co, England, they could go to 
Fernmanagh the way of the Barton.

                                                                             Carr (Kerr)
The Barton's of Barton House, and Barton of Lancashire, 
County, England. A good family which two different 
generations speak up to defend people from being witches. 
The family which brought forth Clara Barton, of Oxford, MA, 
which establishes The American Red Cross.



Elizabeth the wife of Edward Barton, Fermanagh ca 1630



It is likely that both the Ellot and Barton of Ulster had Church 
of Ireland roots.





Eliza Barton the wife of Edward Barton ca 1640 Salem.

The other family the Kerr, known for there would you believe 
left handedness. Felt to be apart of the group of Northern 
Lancashire County, referred to Traitors or Thieves of Leven.



But someone in a search for self climbs a hill just south of 
Rimington, called Pendle Hill.





And is of a people which have a history;

Though a Y-DNA evidence is left in Scotland with the Kerr, it 
is best to say we went the way of the Bartons and we like the 
Bartons are English. We are not “Traitors of Thieves of 
Leven” though we are English.

Sometimes the search gets to overwhelming for the 
(re)searcher.
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